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A Praxis driven Activity

Animation Practice is driven by the creative act, the praxis, that is 
revealed in many ways in the animated works (1, 2, 3). Animation 
Historians, Scholars, and Creators describe the animated works as 

technical, artistic, and organisational achievements, expanding their 
analysis to the whole Thing we call Animation (4). 



The words 
and the 

thing



An Anthropological Approach

Adopting the methodology of Anthropologists, some of the theorists of 
Animation try to discover entanglements, affordances and 

dependencies between the creators and the animated works, unveiling 
patterns and trends that resist over time and sometimes show a 

developmental course (5). 



The importance of historical data

By juxtaposing important developments in the History of Animation in 
a timeline from 1892 to now we can travel through 3 ages of Animation 

(pre-cinema, cinema, digital), understand that European Animators 
contributed significant advances to the aesthetic content and to the 
meaning of animated works while US Animators leaded the way to 
standardize the production process, and appreciate the role of the 

dissemination (festivals, education, cinema theaters, television, digital 
distribution) in the making of animated works (6, 7).





The importance of Design

By further examining the changes occurring over time in the practice, 
process, and production of animated works we can observe interesting 
evolutions. Animation practice seems to involve a creative team rather 
than one creator and to be regulated by more design than before (8), 

as exemplified by the communication of various design documents 
such as storyboards and animation bibles between the members of the 

creative team (9). 





The importance of Dissemination

Both the creative and the production processes incorporate applied 
research during the development stage, proposing solutions to creative 

problems and adapting production pipelines to the needs of the 
animated work. 

The production of the work itself changes to accommodate the needs 
for dissemination such as pitching expectations, distribution deadlines, 

and merchandising deals (10).





The importance of Evolutive Ecosystems

The changes observed in Animation Practice over time merit a wider

framework of Research tools, notions, and strategies, adopting

Anthropological methods to understand the thingness of Animation,

i.e. how creators and their works are forming evolutive ecosystems

(11). This paper attempts to put the premises of an 'Animation Practice

as Research' framework, giving to the researchers both the vocabulary

and the context to design and deliver Research outcomes.



Development 
Stages

Development 

Category

Deliverables

Early Stage Draft Script, Sample Storyboard, 

Literary Bible, Character Design, 

Sample Set Design, Animation tests, 

Possibly Pilot

Late Stage Revised Script, Production 

Storyboard, Graphic Bible, Advanced 

Character Design, Advanced Set 

Design, Voice casting, Animatic, 

Production Pipeline Tests, Animation 

teaser



Theoretical Considerations

As far as theoretical notions are concerned, Visual, Cinema and Digital
Media Anthropological theories provide useful methods to question
the Artistic Praxis (12), the Production Process (13), and the Meaning
of the Animation Techniques (14). It is interesting to note though,
despite the entanglements, affordances and dependencies observed
between cinema and animation (15, 16), that influential Animation
theorists provide also adequate tools to link the techniques to the
aesthetics of the animated works (17, 18).



Practical Considerations

Last, as far as the Research context is concerned, we can observe good practice

in Training Networks, Audiovisual Institutes, Residencies, Research Networks,

University Laboratories, but not yet an International Doctoral School in

'Animation Practice as Research', partially due to the lack of an adequate

framework, certainly due to the time needed to research, like archaeologists

do, an important number of data covering many years of creative practice. An

insight on how to design an 'Animation Techniques versus Aesthetics'

framework for master's degree theses will clarify the mechanics of doing

'Animation Practice as Research' in a Design Engineering Department (19).





Animation 
Production 

Figures

Film Category Film 

Duration

Shots 

Number

Production 

Duration

Production 

Cost (US 

Dollars)

Feature 2D/CGI 75-85’ 1250-1500 2-3,5 years 15.000.000-

120.000.000

Feature 3D/CGI 75-85’ 1350-1700 2-3,5 years 25.000.000-

100.000.000

Network series-

2D/3D

22’ 350 14-18 weeks 

per episode

300.000-

450.000

TV Specials-

2D/3D

22’ 450-600 9-15 months 650.000-

1.000.000

Shorts- 2D/3D 7’ 60-130 3-6 months 75.000-

650.000
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